Hingyen, Robert J

From: Hingtgen, Robert J

Sent: Wednesday, October 15, 2014 3:27 PM
To: '‘Donna Tisdale'

Subject: RE: Soitec still in arrears?

Donna,

Additional deposits were received on Monday October 13, 2014 and the account is positive again.
Thank you,

Robert Hingtgen, Planner llI

Planning & Development Services

5510 Overland Ave., Suite 310

San Diego, CA 92123

M.S. 0-650

Tel - (858) 694-3712

email - robert.hingtgen@sdcounty.ca.gov

PDS Website: http://www.sandiegocounty.gov/pds/index.html|

From: Donna Tisdale [mailto:tisdale.donna@gmail.com]
Sent: Wednesday, October 15, 2014 1:47 PM

To: Hingtgen, Robert J

Subject: Soitec still in arrears?

Hello Robert,

Can you tell me if Soitec has brought their account up to date, or is it still in deficit as stated in your October
2nd e-mail message posted on the project website?

http://www.sandiegocounty.gov/content/dam/sdc/dplu/cega/Soitec-Documents/Record-Documents/2014-10-06-
RobertHingtgen-email-Account-In-Deficit.pdf

Thank you,

Donna Tisdale
619-766-4170



