Hinglgen, Robert J

From: Hingtgen, Robert J

Sent: Tuesday, February 03, 2015 11:23 AM
To: 'Donna Tisdale'

Cc: Fogg, Mindy; Gungle, Ashiey
Subject: RE: Soitec payment?

Donna,

We have not yet received the deposits that were requested. The deposit money was reportedly wired last week;
however, it has not yet shown up in the developer trust account.

Thank you,

Robert Hingtgen, Planner llI

Planning & Development Services

5510 Overland Ave., Suite 310

San Diego, CA 92123

M.S. 0-650

Tel - (858) 694-3712

email - robert.hingtgen@sdcounty.ca.gov

PDS Website: http://www.sandiegocounty.gov/pds/index.html

From: Donna Tisdale [mailto:tisdale.donna@gmail.com]
Sent: Monday, February 02, 2015 10:30 AM

To: Hingtgen, Robert J

Subject: Soitec payment?

Hello Robert
Has Soitec paid their recent invoice for $40,000 that was due on Friday January 30th?
Thanks

Donna



