Hingtgen, Robert J

From: Hingtgen, Robert J

Sent: Thursday, February 05, 2015 10:35 AM
To: ‘Donna Tisdale'

Subject: RE: Soitec payment?

Donna,

This morning we received a wired deposit in the amount of $80,000 to cover the deposits requested in our invoices of
Jan. 13 and Jan. 23. | will also place email correspondence between staff regarding this deposit in the Administrative
Record.

Thank you,

Robert Hingtgen, Planner il

Planning & Development Services

5510 Overland Ave., Suite 310

San Diego, CA 92123

M.S. 0-650

Tel - (858) 694-3712

email - robert.hingtgen@sdcounty.ca.gov

PDS Website: http://www.sandiegocounty.gov/pds/index.html

From: Donna Tisdale [mailto:tisdale.donna@gmail.com]
Sent: Thursday, February 05, 2015 10:24 AM

To: Hingtgen, Robert J
Subject: Soitec payment?
Hello Robert,

As of yesterday morning, before the Board hearing on Soitec, you confirmed that Soitec had not yet paid their
$40,000 invoice.

Has Soitec paid their invoice yet? If not, why would the County issue the Notice of Determination without that
payment??

Please include my question and your response in the AR for Soitec's projects.
Thank you

Donna Tisdale
619-766-4170



